






































UOHT'EN(aU. GAOUP 

FW: City of Geneva to The Burton Foundation 
1 message 

Tracey Manning <t.manning@theburtonfoundation.org> 
To: "sharnette@lightengalegroup.com" <sharnette@lightengalegroup.com> 

See below. 

Thank you. 

Tracey L. Manning 

President 

2090 Larkin Avenue, Suite 5A-1 

Elgin, IL 60123 

Office: 630-938-7625 

Fax: 630-938-7626 

Cell: 630-880-3160 

From: Charles Radovich <radovichlaw@sbcglobal.net> 
Sent: Monday, April 13, 2020 10:50 AM 
To: Peter Quigley <pquigley@pcqlaw.com> 

Sharnette Brown <sharnette@lightengalegroup.com> 

Mon, Apr 13, 2020 at 10:59 AM 

Cc: Stephanie Dawkins <sdawkins@geneva.il.us>; David DeGroot <ddegroot@geneva.il.us>; Tracey Manning <t.manning@theburtonfoundation.org> 
Subject: Re: City of Geneva to The Burton Foundation 

Peter 

The City can provide you the form of the agreement this morning but the City Council will need to approve it before it can be signed by a city officer. The City 
Administrator can place it on the agenda for the April 20th meeting. 

Charles A. Radovich 
Radovich Law Office, PC 
Attorney at Law 
312 West State Street, P.O. Box 464 
Geneva, IL 60134 
630/232-4515 
630/232-0189 facsimile 

This communication, along with any documents, files or attachments, is intended only for the use of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and confidential 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of any information contained in or attached 
to this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy the original communication 
and its attachments without reading, printing or saving in any manner. This communication does not form any contractual obligation on behalf of the sender or 
Radovich Law Office, P.C .. Unless expressly stated otherwise, any tax advice in this message is not intended or written to be used, and cannot be used by a taxpayer, 
for the purpose of avoiding penalties that may be imposed on the taxpayer. Please consult your tax attorney regarding the form of tax advice that may be relied upon 
to avoid penalties under the Internal Revenue Code. 

On Monday, April 13, 2020, 09:55:24 AM CDT, Peter Quigley <pquigley@pcqlaw.com> wrote: 

I realize this is coming at you last minute but the deadline is at I 2 00 noon. Is there any way that this can be expedited. Thanks 

Peter C. Quigley 

53 West Jackson; Suite 601 



Chicago, Illinois 60604 

Phone: 312-386-9663 

Fax: 312-386-9664 

Email: pquigley@pcqlaw.com 

From: Charles Radovich <radovichlaw@sbcglobal.net> 
Reply-To: Charles Radovich <radovichlaw@sbcglobal.net> 
Date: Monday, April 13, 2020 at 9:52 AM 
To: Peter Quigley <pquigley@pcqlaw.com> 
Cc: Stephanie Dawkins <sdawkins@geneva.il.us>, David DeGroot <ddegroot@geneva.il.us> 
Subject: Re: City of Geneva to The Burton Foundation 

Peter 

Your revisions, including your request for a financing contingency, were submitted to the City Administrator last week. I will let you know of her decision 
after she and the Development Director review them. 

C. Radovich

Charles A. Radovich 
Radovich Law Office, PC 
Attorney at Law 
312 West State Street, P.O. Box 464 
Geneva, IL 60134 
630/232-4515 
630/232-0189 facsimile 

This communication, along with any documents, files or attachments, is intended only for the use of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and confidential 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of any information contained in or attached 
to this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy the original communication 
and its attachments without reading, printing or saving in any manner. This communication does not form any contractual obligation on behalf of the sender or 
Radovich Law Office, P.C .. Unless expressly stated otherwise, any tax advice in this message is not intended or written to be used, and cannot be used by a taxpayer, 
for the purpose of avoiding penalties that may be imposed on the taxpayer. Please consult your tax attorney regarding the form of tax advice that may be relied upon 
to avoid penalties under the Internal Revenue Code. 

On Monday, April 13, 2020, 09:43:35 AM CDT, Peter Quigley <pquigley@pcqlaw.com> wrote: 

Chuck: 

I have not heard back from you on this. Can you please advise as to status. I need to get this done as soon as possible. 

Please advise. 

Thanks. 

Peter C. Quigley 

53 West Jackson; Suite 601 

Chicago, Illinois 60604 

Phone: 312-386-9663 











































PROPERTY DONATION AGREEMENT

THIS PROPERTY DONATION AGREEMENT 13
day of April 2019, is by and between the James Bergman and The Burton Foundation, an 
Illinois not-for-profit corporation hereinafter Do or TBF ).

RECITALS

WHEREAS, Donor has an option to purchase that certain parcel commonly known as 
37W260 Kaneville Rd, Geneva, Illinois 60134; containing approximately 3.85 acres legally 
described in Exhibit A attached hereto and made a part hereof, with Property Index Numbers PIN 
No. 12-08-200-064 ;

WHEREAS, Donee has proposed to develop the Property with an affordable  multifamily 

the development of the Project by Donee;

AGREEMENTS

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants and provisions herein 
contained, and other good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are 
hereby acknowledged, the parties hereby covenant and agree as follows:

1. Donation.  Donor upon purchase of the Property hereby agrees to donate the Property

receipt of at least thirty (30) days prior
Property will terminate on upon the expiration of Donor s option to purchase the Property, unless 
otherwise extended by the parties. In addition, Donor is 
conditioned upon Donee obtaining, by December 31,2020 an allocation of federal low-income 
housing tax credits for the development of the Property in
judgment) to finance the Project.

2. Donation Process.   Donor will donate the Property by a deed and other applicable
conveyance documents; the deed will be a special warranty deed with the Donor only representing 
that it has taken no action to affect the condition of title shown on the title commitment ordered by 
Donee.  There will be no proration of taxes at closing.  Donee will pay all title charges and recording 
costs relating to the donation.  The Property will be trans

3. IAHTC Allocation. Donee agrees to apply to the Illinois Housing Development
Authority for an allocation of Illinois Affordable Housing Tax Credits (IAHTCs) equal to fifty 
percent (50%) of the value of this donated land. The IAHTC allocation will be used by Donor or its 
assigns. If Donor transfers the certificate to a third party to monetize the allocation, Donor will 
provide the required consideration to Donee, up to $10,000 per transfer as required by IAHTC 
regulations. 

4. Environmental Review. If an environmental review of the Property is required under
federal law, Donor and Donee agree and acknowledge that Donee will have no obligation to accept 
donation of the Property, and the donation of the Property will not occur, until the Illinois Housing 
D written notification to Donor that  it has completed 



any applicable environmental review of the Property and determined that (i) the donation may 
proceed (which may be subject to the resolution of issued identified in the environmental review, 
either before or after the donation), or (ii) the donation is exempt from environmental review 
requirements.  

5. Voluntary Acquisition. Donor and Donee agree and acknowledge that the Donee 
does not have the power of eminent domain over the Property, Donor is not an owner-occupant of the
Property, and that no tenants will be relocated in connection with the Project.

6. Representations and Warranties of Donee. TBF represents and warrants the
following to Donor as of the date of this Agreement and as of the date the donation is made:

(a) TBF has the authority to enter into this Agreement and carry out the transactions 
contemplated hereunder.  

(b) The execution, delivery and performance by TBF of this Agreement and accepting
the donation have been duly authorized and are valid and binding upon and enforceable against TBF
in accordance with the applicable terms of this Agreement. The person executing this Agreement 
and all related documents is fully authorized to do so.

7. Miscellaneous.

a. Headings. The titles and headings contained in this Agreement are included 
for purposes of convenience only and shall not be considered a part of this Agreement in construing 
or interpreting any provision hereof.

b. Governing Law.  This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in 
accordance with the internal laws of the State of Illinois.  If there is a lawsuit under this Agreement, 
the parties agree to submit to the jurisdiction of the courts of Cook County, the State of Illinois and 
the United States District Court for the Northern District of Illinois.

c. Notices. All notices, requests and demands to be made hereunder shall be 
made in writing and addressed as set forth below and shall be given by either of the following 
means: (i) by prepaid, receipted nationally recognized overnight delivery service (including, but not 
limited to, Federal Express, Express Mail, or United Parcel Service); or (ii) registered or certified 
United States mail, return receipt requeste
by notice to the other parties given in the same manner as provided above.  Any notice, demand or 
request sent pursuant to clause (i) shall be deemed received upon such delivery, and, if sent pursuant
to clause (ii) shall be deemed received five business days following deposit in the mail.

If to TBF: Tracey L. Manning, Executive Director
The Burton Foundation
2090 Larkin Avenue, Suite 5A-1
Elgin, IL 60123



with a copy to: Law Offices of Peter C. Quigley
53 West Jackson; Suite 601
Chicago, Illinois 60604

If to Donor: James N. Bergman
2205 Kimberly Drive Office
Bettendorf, IA 52722

with a copy to: Mathew M. Keegan
Ward, Murray, Pace & Johnson, P.C.
226 W. River Street | P.O. Box 404
Dixon, Illinois 61021
P: 815.625.8200 | F: 815.625.8363

d. Counterparts.  This Agreement may be executed in counterparts, each of 
which will be an original, and all of which, taken together, will constitute a single instrument and 
constitute the entire understanding of the parties hereto. The exchange of copies of this Agreement 
and of signature pages by facsimile or electronic transmission will constitute effective execution and 
delivery of this Agreement as to the parties and may be used in lieu of the original agreement for all 
purposes.  Signatures of the parties transmitted by facsimile or electronic transmission will be 
deemed to be their original signatures for all purposes.

e. Successors and Assigns.  No party may assign any of its rights or obligations 
hereunder, by operation of law or otherwise, without the prior written approval of the other parties
which approval shall not be unreasonably withheld, conditioned or delayed.  This Agreement shall 
be binding upon and inure to the benefit of each of the parties hereto and its respective successors 
and assigns.

f. Third Party Beneficiaries.  Nothing in this Agreement, express or implied, 
shall be deemed to create in any person other than the parties signatory hereto and successors and 
assigns permitted hereby, any right, remedy, or claim under or by reason of this Agreement.

g. Attorneys . Each party shall pay its own attor
with the review, drafting and negotiation of all documents and transactions contemplated by this 
Agreement and advice related to it through the closing of such document or transaction.

h. Entire Agreement; Amendments; Waivers.  This Agreement (including the 
documents delivered pursuant hereto), constitutes the entire agreement of the parties hereto 
pertaining to the subject matter contained herein and supersedes all prior agreements or letters of 
intent of the parties hereto.  This Agreement shall not be amended, modified, or supplemented 
except by a written instrument signed by an authorized representative of each of the parties hereto.  
The failure of any party hereto to enforce at any time any provision of this Agreement shall not be
construed to be a waiver of such provision nor in any way to affect the validity of this Agreement or 
any part hereof or the right of any party thereafter to enforce each and every such provision.  No 
waiver of any breach of this Agreement shall be held to constitute a waiver of any other or 
subsequent breach.  



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Property Donation 
Agreement to be signed below.

DONOR:

James N. Bergman

DONEE:

The Burton Foundation, an Illinois not-for-profit corporation

By: 
Its: President



EXHIBIT A

LEGAL DESCPRTION

THAT PART OF THE NORTHEAST 1/4 OF SECTION 8, TOWNSHIP 39 NORTH, RANGE 8 
EAST OF THE THIRD PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS: BEGINNING 
AT THE SOUTHWEST 
COUNTY, ILLINOIS, BEING ON THE ORIGINAL CENTERLINE  OF KANEVILLE ROAD; 
THENCE SOUTHWESTERLY ALONG SAID CENTERLINE 298.65 FEET; THENCE 
NORTHWESTERLY ALONG A LINE FORMING AN ANGLE OF 72 DEGREES, 44 
MINUTES, 40 SECONDS WITH THE LAST DESCRIBED COURSE (MEASURED COUNTER 
CLOCKWISE THEREFROM) 117.58 FEET; THENCE NORTHWESTERLY ALONG A CURVE 
TO THE LEFT HAVING A RADIUS OF 840.0 FEET THAT IS TANGENT TO THE LAST 
DESCRIBED COURSE AT THE LAST DESCRIBED POINT 350.0 FEET; THENCE 
NORTHEASTERLY ALONG A LINE THAT IS RADIAL TO THE LAST DESCRIBED CURVE 
AT THE LAST DESCRIBED POINT 224.0 FEET; THENCE EASTERLY ALONG A LINE
FORMING AN ANGLE OF 138 DEGREES, 28 MINUTES, 56 SECONDS WITH THE LAST
DESCRIBED COURSE (MEASURED COUNTER CLOCKWISE THEREFROM) 284.39 FEET 

WEST LINE FORMING AN ANGLE OF 90 DEGREES, 00 MINUTES, 00 SECONDS WITH 
THE LAST DESCRIBED COURSE (MEASURED COUNTER CLOCKWISE THEREFROM) 
391.83 FEET TO THE SAID CENTERLINE OF KANEVILLE ROAD AND THE POINT OF 
BEGINNING, IN GENEVA TOWNSHIP, KANE COUNTY, ILLINOIS.

Permanent Index Number: 12-08-200-064

Commonly known as: 37W260 Kaneville Road, Geneva, Illinois 60134



EXHIBIT B

ADDENDUM TO PROPERTY DONATION AGREEMENT DATED APRIL_____, 2020 
BETWEEN JAMES N. BERGMAN ( DONOR ) AND THE BURTON FOUNDATION

DONEE ).

SITE CONTROL COMPLIANCE

I. Environmental Review

Notwithstanding any other provision of this Agreement, Donee shall have no obligation to purchase
the Real Estate, and no transfer of title to the Donee may occur, unless and until Illinois Housing
Development Authority has provided Donee and/or Donor with a written notification that:

1) IHDA has completed a federally required environmental review and its request for release of
federal funds has been approved and, subject to any other contingencies in this Purchase and Sale
Agreement,

a. The purchase may proceed, or
b. The purchase may proceed only if certain conditions to address issues in the environmental
review shall be satisfied before or after the purchase of the Real Estate; or

2) It has determined that the purchase is exempt from federal environmental review and a
request for release of funds is not required. IHDA shall use its best efforts to conclude the
environmental review of the property expeditiously.

II. Voluntary Acquisition

Donee is interested in acquiring property for a proposed project which may receive funding
assistance from the U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Development (HUD).

Donee does not have authority to acquire property by eminent domain. In the event Donee and 
Donor cannot reach an amicable agreement for the purchase of property, Donee will not pursue this 
proposed acquisition.

Donee is prepared to offer the Donor $10. Donee believes this amount represents the current market
value of Real Estate.

In accordance with the Uniform Relocation Assistance and Real Property Acquisition Policies Act
(URA), owner-occupants who move as a result of a voluntary acquisition are not eligible for
relocation assistance. Tenant-occupants displaced as a result of a voluntary acquisition may be 
entitled to URA relocation assistance and must be so informed per 49 CFR 24.2(a)(15)(iv)
Initiations of negotiations, and 49 CFR 24 Appendix A - 24.2(a)(15)(iv).




